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were minded to testify our "respect to the first fundamental national law "establishing a firm and
unchangeable order "in the succession to the Throne. And in con"sequence hereof, remaining faithful to the
"oath which we had taken, We used all our "efforts and strongly insisted that the whole "Empire should
follow our example; and this "We did, not out of any desire to deny the "reality of the decision announced by
His "Highness, and still less out of disobedience to "the commands--by Us ever held most sacred "--of His
Majesty the late Emperor, our com"mon father and benefactor, but out of a wish "to preserve from every
peril the fundamental "law regulating the succession of the Throne, "to guard against the faintest shadow of
sus"picion as to the purity of Our intentions, and "to save Our beloved Country from the slightest "and most
momentary uncertainty with respect "to its lawful Sovereign. This determination "embraced by Us in purity
of conscience, be"fore the God who seeth the secrets of all "hearts, was still further confirmed by the
ap"proval and the blessing of Her Majesty the "Empress Maria Feodorovna, Our most beloved "Mother. "In
the mean time the melancholy news of "the decease of His Majesty the Emperor had "reached Warsaw,
direct from Taganrbg, on "the 25th of November, two days earlier than "it had taken to arrive here.
Remaining im"moveable in his determination, His Highness "the Cesarevitch and Grand Duke Constantine
"Pavlovitch, on the day after he had received "the intelligence, viz. the 26th November, "thought fit to
confirm it anew by two acts, "confid...
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From reader reviews:

Hye Elliott:

The book The accession of Nicholas I will bring that you the new experience of reading a book. The author
style to spell out the idea is very unique. When you try to find new book to see, this book very appropriate to
you. The book The accession of Nicholas I is much recommended to you to study. You can also get the e-
book from your official web site, so you can quickly to read the book.

Johnny Grady:

The actual book The accession of Nicholas I has a lot of knowledge on it. So when you check out this book
you can get a lot of help. The book was published by the very famous author. The author makes some
research prior to write this book. This kind of book very easy to read you may get the point easily after
looking over this book.

Helen Hanson:

People live in this new day time of lifestyle always try to and must have the extra time or they will get lot of
stress from both everyday life and work. So , once we ask do people have spare time, we will say absolutely
sure. People is human not just a robot. Then we question again, what kind of activity do you possess when
the spare time coming to anyone of course your answer will certainly unlimited right. Then ever try this one,
reading publications. It can be your alternative in spending your spare time, the particular book you have
read is The accession of Nicholas I.

Andrew Gillon:

Beside that The accession of Nicholas I in your phone, it could give you a way to get nearer to the new
knowledge or facts. The information and the knowledge you are going to got here is fresh from oven so don't
always be worry if you feel like an previous people live in narrow commune. It is good thing to have The
accession of Nicholas I because this book offers to you personally readable information. Do you sometimes
have book but you don't get what it's all about. Oh come on, that won't happen if you have this in your hand.
The Enjoyable arrangement here cannot be questionable, just like treasuring beautiful island. Techniques you
still want to miss it? Find this book in addition to read it from today!
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