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This book gives a fascinating account of the unique history of the national - creole - language of Mauritius
and the process of standardization that it is undergoing in postcolonial times. The central question is how far
a creative writer's activity may affect the status and linguistic forms of a regional language. The book focuses
on the work of the author Dev Virahsawmy, who, particularly through his Shakespeare translations, is an
active agent in the standardization of Mauritian creole. The approaches employed in From Creole to
Standard combine a sociolinguistic examination of (changing) language attitudes with detailed textual
studies of some of Virahsawmy's works to show the relation of his work to the process of language
development. This book is relevant to the study of other creole languages undergoing standardization as well
as to questions of language development more widely. Its strength lies precisely in its interdisciplinary
approach, which addresses different readerships. Mooneeram's study is of great interest to both postcolonial
thinking and sociolinguistics but also has important implications for debates about the role of canonical
literary works and their transmission in the wider world. Her book is also a contribution to Shakespeare
studies and the field of literary linguistics. There are interesting parallels between the contemporary situation
of Mauritian creole and English in the sixteenth and seventeenth centuries. Virahsawmy's adaptations and
translations into creole echo the role Shakespeare's 'originals' played for English, and Mooneeram
demonstrates how other writers have followed Virahsawmy in using literary forms to enrich the language.
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From reader reviews:

Billy Reynolds:

Information is provisions for individuals to get better life, information currently can get by anyone on
everywhere. The information can be a information or any news even an issue. What people must be consider
if those information which is inside former life are difficult to be find than now's taking seriously which one
is suitable to believe or which one the particular resource are convinced. If you obtain the unstable resource
then you obtain it as your main information it will have huge disadvantage for you. All those possibilities
will not happen in you if you take From Creole to Standard: Shakespeare, Language, and Literature in a
Postcolonial Context. (Cross/Cultures) as the daily resource information.

Quentin Ryan:

The book untitled From Creole to Standard: Shakespeare, Language, and Literature in a Postcolonial
Context. (Cross/Cultures) contain a lot of information on this. The writer explains her idea with easy
approach. The language is very clear and understandable all the people, so do not necessarily worry, you can
easy to read that. The book was published by famous author. The author will take you in the new period of
time of literary works. You can actually read this book because you can please read on your smart phone, or
program, so you can read the book with anywhere and anytime. If you want to buy the e-book, you can start
their official web-site and order it. Have a nice go through.

David Cain:

In this era which is the greater man or who has ability to do something more are more treasured than other.
Do you want to become one among it? It is just simple solution to have that. What you must do is just
spending your time little but quite enough to experience a look at some books. One of many books in the top
record in your reading list is definitely From Creole to Standard: Shakespeare, Language, and Literature in a
Postcolonial Context. (Cross/Cultures). This book that is certainly qualified as The Hungry Hillsides can get
you closer in growing to be precious person. By looking up and review this publication you can get many
advantages.

Rene King:

What is your hobby? Have you heard this question when you got scholars? We believe that that problem was
given by teacher for their students. Many kinds of hobby, All people has different hobby. Therefore you
know that little person similar to reading or as reading become their hobby. You need to understand that
reading is very important and also book as to be the issue. Book is important thing to include you knowledge,
except your own personal teacher or lecturer. You discover good news or update about something by book.
Different categories of books that can you decide to try be your object. One of them is From Creole to
Standard: Shakespeare, Language, and Literature in a Postcolonial Context. (Cross/Cultures).
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