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In the years following World War II, Americans visited the national parks in unprecedented numbers, yet
Congress held funding at prewar levels and park conditions steadily declined. Elimination of the Civilian
Conservation Corps and other New Deal programs further reduced the ability of the federal government to
keep pace with the wear and tear on park facilities.

To address the problem, in 1956 a ten-year, billion-dollar initiative titled "Mission 66" was launched, timed
to be completed in 1966, the fiftieth anniversary of the National Park Service. The program covered more
than one hundred visitor centers (a building type invented by Mission 66 planners), expanded campgrounds,
innumerable comfort stations and other public facilities, new and wider roads, parking lots, maintenance
buildings, and hundreds of employee residences. During this transformation, the park system also acquired
new seashores, recreation areas, and historical parks, agency uniforms were modernized, and the arrowhead
logo became a ubiquitous symbol. To a significant degree, the national park system and the National Park
Service as we know them today are products of the Mission 66 era.

Mission 66 was controversial at the time, and it continues to incite debate over the policies it represented.
Hastening the advent of the modern environmental movement, it transformed the Sierra Club from a regional
mountaineering club into a national advocacy organization. But Mission 66 was also the last systemwide,
planned development campaign to accommodate increased numbers of automotive tourists. Whatever our
judgment of Mission 66, we still use the roads, visitor centers, and other facilities the program built.

Ethan Carr's book examines the significance of the Mission 66 program and explores the influence of
midcentury modernism on landscape design and park planning. Environmental and park historians,
architectural and landscape historians, and all who care about our national parks will enjoy this copiously
illustrated history of a critical period in the development of the national park system.

Published in association with Library of American Landscape History: http://lalh.org/
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From reader reviews:

Norberto Brody:

The book with title Mission 66: Modernism and the National Park Dilemma posesses a lot of information
that you can find out it. You can get a lot of benefit after read this book. This specific book exist new
knowledge the information that exist in this publication represented the condition of the world currently.
That is important to yo7u to find out how the improvement of the world. This book will bring you inside new
era of the syndication. You can read the e-book with your smart phone, so you can read that anywhere you
want.

Deborah Tate:

The actual book Mission 66: Modernism and the National Park Dilemma has a lot details on it. So when you
make sure to read this book you can get a lot of gain. The book was compiled by the very famous author.
The author makes some research prior to write this book. This kind of book very easy to read you can get the
point easily after looking over this book.

Harry Duffey:

Reading a book for being new life style in this year; every people loves to examine a book. When you study
a book you can get a great deal of benefit. When you read publications, you can improve your knowledge,
simply because book has a lot of information onto it. The information that you will get depend on what sorts
of book that you have read. If you would like get information about your study, you can read education
books, but if you act like you want to entertain yourself look for a fiction books, these kinds of us novel,
comics, and also soon. The Mission 66: Modernism and the National Park Dilemma will give you new
experience in reading through a book.

Richard Powe:

In this era globalization it is important to someone to find information. The information will make you to
definitely understand the condition of the world. The health of the world makes the information much easier
to share. You can find a lot of personal references to get information example: internet, newspapers, book,
and soon. You will see that now, a lot of publisher this print many kinds of book. The actual book that
recommended for your requirements is Mission 66: Modernism and the National Park Dilemma this
publication consist a lot of the information with the condition of this world now. This book was represented
how can the world has grown up. The language styles that writer value to explain it is easy to understand.
The particular writer made some exploration when he makes this book. Here is why this book suitable all of
you.
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