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This illustrated guide is packed with interesting facts and follows the history of the famous Harley-Davidson
company and the development of its famous bikes, which have earned a special place in the hearts of
enthusiasts everywhere. The story dates from 1903 when Bill Harley and the Davidson brothers, with no
thought of fame or fortune, decided to build a motorcycle that really worked. So successful was it, that it led
to the gradual formation of a company that has survived through good times and bad.

Through good times and bad, losing and winning back police contracts, as well as weathering various other
vicissitudes, the company has achieved lasting success. In the end, Harley-Davidson came to the ultimate
decision of giving its customers what they really wanted, not by providing year-on-year innovations, but by
remaining true to the Founders' original concept. The result, as everyone knows, are bikes of mythic status,
imbued with a mysterious quality of their own and generating a passion in enthusiasts amounting almost to a
love affair. The name has come to personify America and is up there alongside Coca-Cola, Ford and
McDonald's.

The bikes are described in detail, not only in mechanical terms, but also with glorious photographs, and will
be of interest to everyone who loves motorbikes: even aficionados of Japanese and European bikes, who
have never even ridden a Harley-Davidson, will be able to recognize the unique marriage of style and
nostalgia and the fact that there are no other bikes quite like them.
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From reader reviews:

Larry Young:

The particular book Harley-Davidson: An Illustrated Guide has a lot info on it. So when you check out this
book you can get a lot of profit. The book was published by the very famous author. The author makes some
research previous to write this book. That book very easy to read you can get the point easily after reading
this article book.

James Peterson:

People live in this new day time of lifestyle always make an effort to and must have the time or they will get
lots of stress from both way of life and work. So , once we ask do people have free time, we will say
absolutely of course. People is human not really a huge robot. Then we consult again, what kind of activity
do you have when the spare time coming to you actually of course your answer will certainly unlimited right.
Then do you ever try this one, reading books. It can be your alternative in spending your spare time, the
actual book you have read is actually Harley-Davidson: An Illustrated Guide.

Sophia Morrison:

Is it an individual who having spare time subsequently spend it whole day by means of watching television
programs or just lying on the bed? Do you need something new? This Harley-Davidson: An Illustrated Guide
can be the answer, oh how comes? A fresh book you know. You are therefore out of date, spending your
extra time by reading in this new era is common not a geek activity. So what these guides have than the
others?

Kay Newberry:

Don't be worry should you be afraid that this book will certainly filled the space in your house, you can have
it in e-book means, more simple and reachable. This particular Harley-Davidson: An Illustrated Guide can
give you a lot of buddies because by you considering this one book you have point that they don't and make
you more like an interesting person. This specific book can be one of a step for you to get success. This
guide offer you information that possibly your friend doesn't recognize, by knowing more than other make
you to be great persons. So , why hesitate? We should have Harley-Davidson: An Illustrated Guide.
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