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This book provides a listing of 920 general-interest consumer magazines that specialize geographically.
Comprising this highly active magazine genre are city magazines (i.e., New York, Washingtonian); regional
magazines (Sunset, Vermont Life); city speciality magazines (Houston Home and Garden, Hartford Woman),
which specialize both geographically and by subject matter; and regional speciality magazines (Southern
Homes, Virginia Wildlife). The book's three main sections--arranged alphabetically by title, chronologically
by founding date, and geographically by state--cover regional interest magazines that have been in
publication since 1950. Each entry in the alphabetical listing shows title, any known title changes, dates of
publication, city and state of publication, and a sample of libraries that hold files of the magazine's back
issues.

For historical perspective, an appendix provides a representative alphabetical listing of magazines that
published and perished prior to 1950 and that identified themselves by city, state, or region. The index's
companion volume, Regional Interest Magazines of the United States (Greenwood), forthcoming, will
contain in-depth profiles of roughly 100 of these magazines. This unique reference source will make a
valuable addition to any library.

 Download Index to City and Regional Magazines of the United ...pdf

 Read Online Index to City and Regional Magazines of the Unit ...pdf

http://bookengine.site/go/read.php?id=0313268398
http://bookengine.site/go/read.php?id=0313268398
http://bookengine.site/go/read.php?id=0313268398
http://bookengine.site/go/read.php?id=0313268398
http://bookengine.site/go/read.php?id=0313268398
http://bookengine.site/go/read.php?id=0313268398
http://bookengine.site/go/read.php?id=0313268398
http://bookengine.site/go/read.php?id=0313268398


Download and Read Free Online Index to City and Regional Magazines of the United States
(Historical Guides to the World's Periodicals and Newspapers) Sam Riley, Gary W. Selnow

From reader reviews:

Beth Ritchey:

Information is provisions for those to get better life, information currently can get by anyone on everywhere.
The information can be a know-how or any news even a concern. What people must be consider if those
information which is inside former life are challenging be find than now's taking seriously which one would
work to believe or which one often the resource are convinced. If you have the unstable resource then you
obtain it as your main information you will see huge disadvantage for you. All those possibilities will not
happen within you if you take Index to City and Regional Magazines of the United States (Historical Guides
to the World's Periodicals and Newspapers) as the daily resource information.

Maria Ives:

Reading a book tends to be new life style in this era globalization. With studying you can get a lot of
information which will give you benefit in your life. Together with book everyone in this world can certainly
share their idea. Guides can also inspire a lot of people. Plenty of author can inspire their own reader with
their story or maybe their experience. Not only situation that share in the guides. But also they write about
the ability about something that you need instance. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach your
children, there are many kinds of book which exist now. The authors on this planet always try to improve
their proficiency in writing, they also doing some analysis before they write to their book. One of them is this
Index to City and Regional Magazines of the United States (Historical Guides to the World's Periodicals and
Newspapers).

James Brown:

The book untitled Index to City and Regional Magazines of the United States (Historical Guides to the
World's Periodicals and Newspapers) contain a lot of information on the idea. The writer explains your ex
idea with easy technique. The language is very clear and understandable all the people, so do not worry, you
can easy to read this. The book was compiled by famous author. The author will bring you in the new era of
literary works. You can read this book because you can continue reading your smart phone, or program, so
you can read the book inside anywhere and anytime. If you want to buy the e-book, you can open their
official web-site in addition to order it. Have a nice go through.

Juan Crowe:

Do you like reading a book? Confuse to looking for your preferred book? Or your book was rare? Why so
many query for the book? But almost any people feel that they enjoy intended for reading. Some people likes
studying, not only science book but novel and Index to City and Regional Magazines of the United States
(Historical Guides to the World's Periodicals and Newspapers) or even others sources were given knowledge
for you. After you know how the good a book, you feel would like to read more and more. Science
publication was created for teacher or students especially. Those ebooks are helping them to bring their



knowledge. In additional case, beside science e-book, any other book likes Index to City and Regional
Magazines of the United States (Historical Guides to the World's Periodicals and Newspapers) to make your
spare time far more colorful. Many types of book like this.
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