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In my mind I have always been ugly. Even when I look back at old childhood photos and realize that I was
kind of cute at times, I never felt that way. Somehow it was branded on my soul that everyone else was
prettier than me, and thereby, I somehow concluded, inherently superior. I don’t know why I felt that way -
only that I did.
It didn’t help that those anguishing suspicions about my hideousness found justification in the form of my
personal tormentors. In other words, there has been a long string of people in my life that have reinforced my
self-perceived disgustingness. On the other hand, despite their efforts in reminding me of my inherent
inferiority, my repulsiveness was already and inexplicably a permanent part of my core essence. In other
words, while it may have made them feel better over the years to remind me of their innate superiority, they
were wasting their time – I already knew it. The question to me was never why people were born superior, it
was how could I level life’s playing field?
Those feelings of worth most people are apparently born with have always been foreign to me. I am
ironically likewise cursed,
however, with the desire to be perceived as at least adequate in the “looks” department – particularly in
regards to females. I always yearned to be a part of the social dynamic, despite my limitations, and
eventually concluded that some level of high achievement – by any means - could blind people to my
hideousness.
Throughout my life, though suffering from temporary bouts of self-pity inherent to those born with my
“looks”, I eventually came to embrace the bizarre way my insecurities manifested into the strange, unique
path my life has taken. My feelings of worthlessness, ironically, have provided the means for my life having
purpose and value. I now embrace the quirky, if not downright weird, path my life took. Only in retrospect,
and reflection, am I now aware of how my self-perceived repulsiveness transformed my journey from
average and boring to at least different.

My life has become the stuff of legends - legendarily lame that is - in the minds of most anyway. For those of
you who see “lam-o” in my actions, I offer you redemption. In exchange for you reading about me, I gift you
the personally redemptive power of joyful exuberance in knowing that you didn’t live my life!
In somewhat chronological order, after first describing the seminal events leading to this book, the memories
forming the mangled mosaic of my deranged thoughts and deeds will be recounted. From the perspective of
a mind operating amidst a thick cloud of profound insecurity and pathos, I offer you the re-telling of a life
inspired by the power of “ugly”.
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From reader reviews:

Calvin Baker:

Nowadays reading books become more and more than want or need but also become a life style. This
reading practice give you lot of advantages. The huge benefits you got of course the knowledge the actual
information inside the book which improve your knowledge and information. The data you get based on
what kind of e-book you read, if you want get more knowledge just go with knowledge books but if you
want sense happy read one together with theme for entertaining for instance comic or novel. Often the God
You're Ugly: Boy is you Ugly is kind of publication which is giving the reader unstable experience.

Mary McKay:

Information is provisions for folks to get better life, information these days can get by anyone from
everywhere. The information can be a know-how or any news even an issue. What people must be consider
while those information which is inside the former life are challenging to be find than now could be taking
seriously which one is appropriate to believe or which one typically the resource are convinced. If you obtain
the unstable resource then you buy it as your main information you will see huge disadvantage for you. All
of those possibilities will not happen with you if you take God You're Ugly: Boy is you Ugly as the daily
resource information.

Frank Ouellette:

A lot of people always spent their free time to vacation or even go to the outside with them family or their
friend. Did you know? Many a lot of people spent that they free time just watching TV, or maybe playing
video games all day long. If you would like try to find a new activity honestly, that is look different you can
read a book. It is really fun in your case. If you enjoy the book that you just read you can spent the whole day
to reading a publication. The book God You're Ugly: Boy is you Ugly it is rather good to read. There are a
lot of people who recommended this book. They were enjoying reading this book. Should you did not have
enough space to bring this book you can buy typically the e-book. You can m0ore effortlessly to read this
book out of your smart phone. The price is not to fund but this book has high quality.

David Reed:

As we know that book is vital thing to add our know-how for everything. By a book we can know everything
you want. A book is a range of written, printed, illustrated or even blank sheet. Every year had been exactly
added. This reserve God You're Ugly: Boy is you Ugly was filled about science. Spend your spare time to
add your knowledge about your scientific disciplines competence. Some people has distinct feel when they
reading the book. If you know how big advantage of a book, you can experience enjoy to read a guide. In the
modern era like at this point, many ways to get book which you wanted.
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