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A prominent member of the second generation of Cambridge Keynesians, Luigi Pasinetti has been a key
player in the development of neo-Ricardian economics as well. Having studied under Piero Sraffa at
Cambridge, he developed a mathematical representation of Ricardo's theory of value and distribution, as well
as the reswitching problem in neoclassical capital theory: thus making him a leader of the British Cambridge
side during the Cambridge Capital Controversy.

Since leaving Cambridge for Rome, he has become particularly interested in structural change, i.e. the
responses of multi-sectoral models of the economy to technical changes.

This book draws together Pasinetti's main contributions in the field of value theory.
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From reader reviews:

Teddy Hathorn:

Here thing why this specific A Theory of Value (Routledge Frontiers of Political Economy) are different and
trustworthy to be yours. First of all looking at a book is good however it depends in the content from it which
is the content is as tasty as food or not. A Theory of Value (Routledge Frontiers of Political Economy) giving
you information deeper including different ways, you can find any reserve out there but there is no e-book
that similar with A Theory of Value (Routledge Frontiers of Political Economy). It gives you thrill reading
journey, its open up your own eyes about the thing this happened in the world which is probably can be
happened around you. It is easy to bring everywhere like in park, café, or even in your technique home by
train. In case you are having difficulties in bringing the published book maybe the form of A Theory of
Value (Routledge Frontiers of Political Economy) in e-book can be your alternate.

Concepcion Maldonado:

Hey guys, do you really wants to finds a new book to read? May be the book with the headline A Theory of
Value (Routledge Frontiers of Political Economy) suitable to you? The actual book was written by renowned
writer in this era. The particular book untitled A Theory of Value (Routledge Frontiers of Political
Economy)is a single of several books in which everyone read now. That book was inspired many men and
women in the world. When you read this e-book you will enter the new dimensions that you ever know prior
to. The author explained their strategy in the simple way, thus all of people can easily to recognise the core
of this reserve. This book will give you a lots of information about this world now. In order to see the
represented of the world in this particular book.

Donald Worsley:

Many people spending their period by playing outside using friends, fun activity along with family or just
watching TV the whole day. You can have new activity to enjoy your whole day by studying a book. Ugh, ya
think reading a book really can hard because you have to accept the book everywhere? It fine you can have
the e-book, delivering everywhere you want in your Cell phone. Like A Theory of Value (Routledge
Frontiers of Political Economy) which is obtaining the e-book version. So , try out this book? Let's observe.

Gary Forsyth:

Guide is one of source of understanding. We can add our understanding from it. Not only for students but
also native or citizen require book to know the upgrade information of year for you to year. As we know
those ebooks have many advantages. Beside many of us add our knowledge, can bring us to around the
world. Through the book A Theory of Value (Routledge Frontiers of Political Economy) we can have more
advantage. Don't you to definitely be creative people? To get creative person must want to read a book.
Merely choose the best book that appropriate with your aim. Don't always be doubt to change your life at this
time book A Theory of Value (Routledge Frontiers of Political Economy). You can more inviting than now.
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