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Since the publication of the first edition of this book in 1987, offshore navigation has undergone a number of
major changes, and this new edition has been thoroughly revised to meet the requirements and expectations
of the current generation of offshore sailors. Some of the most important changes have been dictated by the
effects of climate change on global weather and the availability of the data gathered over the last two
decades by meteorological satellites. This data resulted in the publication of Cornell s Ocean Atlas, which
was produced jointly with Ivan Cornell, and contains monthly pilot charts for all oceans of the world.
Examination of this data highlighted some essential changes that have occurred in the global weather
systems over the years. The revisions in the seventh edition were dictated primarily by the information
contained in the latest pilot charts, which required a rethinking of some old established route planning
tactics, many of which are no longer valid. Another important change made in this edition is the addition of
detailed waypoints on some well-travelled routes, as well as the inclusion of alternative routes leading to
popular cruising destinations. Compared to previous editions, where the waypoints were listed mainly for
planning purposes, in this new edition every waypoint along each route is listed, enabling the navigator to
plot a course for any passage from start to finish. In direct response to current navigational methods, most
routes, and especially those leading to popular cruising destinations, have been redesigned to provide
essential passage planning details. Also, new routes have been added to areas rarely explored until recently
by cruising yachts, from Greenland and Micronesia to China and the Northwest Passage. One new feature
added to this edition is that of windgrams depicting a summary of wind conditions for the month when
passages are undertaken along some of the most commonly sailed routes. The windgrams are a synthesis of
individual windroses as shown in the pilot chart published in Cornell s Ocean Atlas.
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From reader reviews:

Jerry Bates:

Now a day people who Living in the era exactly where everything reachable by interact with the internet and
the resources included can be true or not call for people to be aware of each information they get. How
people have to be smart in acquiring any information nowadays? Of course the correct answer is reading a
book. Studying a book can help persons out of this uncertainty Information particularly this World Cruising
Routes: 7th edition book because this book offers you rich data and knowledge. Of course the data in this
book hundred percent guarantees there is no doubt in it everbody knows.

Athena Thornton:

Nowadays reading books be than want or need but also be a life style. This reading habit give you lot of
advantages. The benefits you got of course the knowledge the particular information inside the book that will
improve your knowledge and information. The details you get based on what kind of reserve you read, if you
want drive more knowledge just go with knowledge books but if you want sense happy read one along with
theme for entertaining for instance comic or novel. Typically the World Cruising Routes: 7th edition is kind
of reserve which is giving the reader unstable experience.

Robert Nichols:

Beside this specific World Cruising Routes: 7th edition in your phone, it might give you a way to get closer
to the new knowledge or info. The information and the knowledge you will got here is fresh from your oven
so don't become worry if you feel like an outdated people live in narrow village. It is good thing to have
World Cruising Routes: 7th edition because this book offers to you readable information. Do you
occasionally have book but you would not get what it's exactly about. Oh come on, that will not end up to
happen if you have this with your hand. The Enjoyable arrangement here cannot be questionable, such as
treasuring beautiful island. So do you still want to miss the idea? Find this book in addition to read it from
currently!

Dale Fain:

A lot of reserve has printed but it is different. You can get it by net on social media. You can choose the top
book for you, science, comic, novel, or whatever by searching from it. It is identified as of book World
Cruising Routes: 7th edition. You can include your knowledge by it. Without leaving the printed book, it
may add your knowledge and make a person happier to read. It is most critical that, you must aware about
reserve. It can bring you from one spot to other place.
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